
The Central by Goodwin: trip to Tahiti competition
Permit No ACT TP 17/00838

Terms and conditions:

To enter the competition you must be present at The Central by Goodwin open 
day, held from 10am to 1pm on Saturday 20 May at 20 Galore St, Crace ACT, and 
complete a paper entry form with your contact details. You must also put your 
name on the Goodwin Register of Interest list, or already be on the Goodwin 
Register of Interest list. By entering the competition you agree to Goodwin Aged 
Care Services and Reis and James Travel Associates, Manuka retaining your 
contact details for marketing purposes. You can opt-out of communications from 
either business by contacting the business directly. Goodwin Aged Care Services 
staff are not eligible to apply.

The lottery commences at 10am on Saturday 20 May and ends at 2pm on 
Saturday 20 May.

The draw will take place at 10am on Friday, 2 June at Goodwin House, 35 Bonney 
Street, Ainslie.

The promoter is Goodwin Aged Care Services. ABN: 82 120 298 946

The winner will be notified on Monday, 5 June by phone and in writing by mail 
(sent Monday, 5 June).

The winner’s name will be published Goodwin Life newsletter, tri-monthly 
newsletter distributed August 2017, Goodwin social media accounts and 
centralbygoodwin.org.au and goodwin.org.au as soon as the winner (or redraw 
winner) have been notified.

The travel prize is kindly provided by Reis and James Travel Associates, Manuka. 
The prize consists of: return economy flights from Sydney to Tahiti for two people, 
7 nights accommodation in Tahiti, including five nights in a minimum 4-star hotel 
in Bora Bora for two people and 2 nights accommodation in transit in Papeete 
for two people. All hotel and airport transfers are included. Spending money, 
visas, travel insurance, gratuities and any other travel costs are not included. Not 
redeemable for cash. The value of the prize is $8000. Valid for travel until 30 June 
2018. Some blackout dates apply. Any travel costs exceeding this value are the 
responsibility of the winner. 

Goodwin will make several attempts to contact the winner using all contact 
information supplied. The winner has three weeks in which to claim the prize 
(meaning they accept prize). If the prize is unclaimed a redraw will take place at 
10am on Friday, 30 June at Goodwin House, 35 Bonney St, Ainslie ACT.


